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NOTICE OF PUBLIC BID OPENING 
 

A public bid opening will be held as follows for the projects listed below: 
 

Date: TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER 23, 2008 
Time: 2:00 P.M. 
Location: CC 6 

21 West Church Street 
Jacksonville, Florida 

 

INVITATION  FOR  BID 

 

WCF-104-08 BEACON HILLS PHASE OUT 16” FORCE 
MAIN PHASE II 

 

JCS-106-08 UNDERGROUND DISTRIBUTION 
FACILITIES & MANHOLE DUCTBANK UNIT 
PRICE CONSTRUCTION & MAINTENANCE 

 

JCS-112-08 REPAIR AND INSTALLATION OF 
AUTOMATIC GATES AND DOORS 
SYSTEMS 

 

JPS-128-08 PLAZA III PARKING GARAGE CONCRETE 
RESTORATION ENGINEERING SERVICES 

 

 



  BID OPENING

IFB  #  WCF-104-08

Minimun Requirements

MANADATORY PR-BID

SAFETY 

RBL - WM3

RECORDED BY:  GWEN JONES PART I (Items 1&2) Part II (Items 3&4)
ADDEN 

(4)
SAFET
Y

MAN - 
PREBD

ROSS & LOGAN INDUSTRIES 557,804.58 806,736.85 x X X

JOHN WOODY, INC. 565,342.50 No Bid x X X

JAX UTILITIES MANAGEMENT, INC. 628,305.70 874,197.60 x X X

CALLAWAY CONTRACTING, INC. 649,128.50 892,532.34 x X X

MORA ENGINEERING CONTRACTORS, 
INC. 659,961.50 No Bid x X X

MIRANDA CONTRACTING 663,270.00 No Bid x X X

T. G. UTILITY COMPANY, INC. 685,397.00 890,436.75 x X X

A. J. JOHNS, INC. 712,500.00 923,800.00 x X X

SLAUGHTER CONSTRUCTION CO. INC. 741,790.00 No Bid x X X

EARTHWORKS OF NE FLORIDA, INC. 769,175.00 949,325.00 x X X

RJ'S UNDERGROUND 770,600.00 No Bid x X X

UNITED BROTHERS DEVELOPMENT 793,559.25 No Bid x X X

PETTICOAT-SCHMITT CIVIL 
CONTRACTORS, INC. 817,092.00 1,007,392.00 x X X

T. B. LANDMARK CONSTRUCTION, INC. 878,347.50 1,031,909.50 x X X

R & B CONTRACTING, INC. 974,985.00 1,143,760.00 x X X

FLORIDA ROADS CONTRACTING, INC. 979,616.81 989,284.89 x X X

GRIMES CONTRACTING 1,011,325.23 1,172,069.39 x X X

J. B. COXWELL CONTRACTING, INC. 1,071,920.00 1,368,050.00 x X X

HAGER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 1,266,902.77 1,556,093.96 x X X

TITLE:  Beacon Hills Phase Out 16" Force Main Phase II

Elizabeth DiMeo - 904-665-8139

OPENING DATE:  September 23, 2008



  BID OPENING

IFB  # JCS-106-08

OPENING DATE:  September 23, 2008 Minimun Requirements

MANADATORY PR-BID
SAFETY 

RBL - EG6

RECORDED BY:  Gwen Jone s BID TABULATION
ADDEN 

(4) SAFETY
MAN - 

PREBD

HENKELS & MCCOY 865,203.28 X X X

C AND C POWERLINE, INC. 880,856.99 X X X

HEWITT CONTRACTING 895,711.03 X X X

IVY H. SMITH 1,141,193.92 X X X

PIKE ELECTRIC, INC. 1,506,679.93 X X X

TITLE:  Underground Distribution Facilities & Manhole 
Ductbank Unit Price Construction & Maintenance

Ray Williams - 904-665-7474



  BID OPENING

IFB  #  JSC-112-08

OPENING DATE:  September 23, 2008 Minimun Requirements

MANADATORY PR-BID
SAFETY 

RBL - LB2

RECORDED BY:  Gwen Jone s BID TABULATION
ADDEN 

(2) SAFETY
MAN - 

PREBD

NORTH FLORIDA BUILDING & CONSTRUCTION 
COMPANY 463,622.00 X X X

ACCESS LIMITED INC. 504,467.00 X X X

VIGNEAUX CORPORATION 528,349.19 X X X

TITLE:  Repair and Installation of Automatic Gates and 
Doors Systems

Brandon Edwards - 904-665-6584



  BID OPENING

IFB  # JPS-128-08

OPENING DATE:  September 23, 2008 Minimun Requirements

MANADATORY PR-BID

RECORDED BY:  Gwen Jone s PROPOSAL SUBMITTED
MAN 

PRE-BID

JENKINS & CHARLAND                                                   
TRC WORLDWIDE ENGINEERING, INC. YES X

WALTER P. MOORE YES X

ATLANTIC ENGINEERING SERVICES YES X

TITLE:  Plaza III Parking Garage Concrete Restoration 
Engineering Services

Charles Newton - 904-665-4828
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